
TANK-GUARD® Protection Plan Overview

• All oil tanks must be pre-qualified prior to initial
TANK-GUARD® treatment. A service technician
will come to your home, review your tank, and
submit an eligibility report to verify that your tank
qualifies for our TANK-GUARD® Plan. We use
visual inspection guidelines as recommended by
the National Oilheat Research Alliance (NORA).

• If your tank qualifies, our service team will
schedule a work order to have your tank treated
with a concentrated TANK-GUARD® liquid
corrosion inhibitor. (You do not need to be home
for this appointment, TANK-GUARD® is
administered through your oil tank’s fill pipe.)

• Your TANK-GUARD® Protection Plan will
automatically be renewed each year and your tank
will be treated annually with the TANK-GUARD® 

corrosion inhibitor.

• The concentration is heavier than oil and settles
at the bottom of the tank to neutralize acidity
and shield the inside bottom of the oil tank with a
molecular film, thus reducing rusting, electrolytic
pitting, and sludge.

• TANK-GUARD® is safe, effective, and does not
affect your furnace’s performance or fuel efficiency.

• If your tank leaks from internal corrosion while it
is enrolled on the Tank-Guard® Program, Palmer
Gas & Oil will arrange to replace the tank, and you
will receive a generous credit toward the
replacement cost.
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• TANK-GUARD® Protection Plans are in effect for
12 months and will be renewed automatically each
year thereafter at prevailing rates. Palmer Gas &
Oil will indicate its acceptance of a plan by issuance
of an invoice, made payable within 30 days. A tank
must be pre-qualified before it is accepted for a
protection plan. Advance payment does not make
a plan become effective.

• Plans canceled within 30 days of renewal date
will receive a full refund provided TANK-GUARD®

product has not been administered for that
renewal. (If TANK-GUARD® has been
administered then no refund will be issued.) Plans
may be canceled after 30 days of renewal date but
there will be no refund of any unused portion of
the plan.

• Plans are for residential customers only.

• A protection plan is transferable to a new owner
at the option of the property seller for the existing
service location, or the plan may be voided at the
owner’s request, but there will be no refund of any
unused portion of the plan.

• Palmer Gas & Oil will endeavor to render prompt
and efficient service, but it is expressly agreed that
Palmer Gas & Oil shall in no event be liable for
damage or loss caused by delay or any loss arising
out of the performance of this plan.

• The customer’s payment constitutes their
acceptance of the terms and conditions of this
protection plan.
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